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Pub Quiz Time!

12 questions, 12 chances to score! 

Pen, pint, and NO Googling!

1. Who surprises Aubrey by asking him out?

2. What bet does Brennan make with Oliver Wells?

3. What surprising discovery does Aubrey make about his father?

4. What medical procedure does Hodgins sign up for?

5. What heartfelt moment does Cam share on camera while the documentary crew is filming the team?

6. What sparks the competition between Hodgins and Oliver?

7. Who returns to help plan Cam’s wedding?

8. What progress does Hodgins make during his physical therapy?

9. What temporary medical issue is Booth diagnosed with?

10. What does Booth need to wear because of his condition?

11. What is the nickname of the serial killer the team is searching for?

12. Who is revealed to be Brennan’s kidnapper?
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Q U E S T I O N A N S W E R D I D  Y O U  K N O W ?

1. Who surprises Aubrey by asking him 

out?

2. What bet does Brennan make with 

Oliver Wells?

3. What surprising discovery does 

Aubrey make about his father?

4. What medical procedure does 

Hodgins sign up for?

5. What heartfelt moment does Cam 

share on camera while the 

documentary crew is filming the 

team?

6. What sparks the competition 

between Hodgins and Oliver?

7. Who returns to help plan Cam’s 

wedding?

8. What progress does Hodgins make 

during his physical therapy?

9. What temporary medical issue is 

Booth diagnosed with?

10. What does Booth need to wear 

because of his condition?

11. What is the nickname of the serial 

killer the team is searching for?

12. Who is revealed to be Brennan’s 

kidnapper?

1. Karen Delfs

2. If Christine is cheating on her 

report card

3. He is back and has started an 

investigation into Aubrey 

himself

4. Experimental surgery to try to 

walk again

5. Confesses her love and 

proposes to Arastoo

6. Oliver beats Hodgins in a 

video game

7. Cam’s sister, Felicia

8. He has a breakthrough when 

a muscle spasm in his leg 

causes him to knock over 

objects

9. An eye condition

10. Glasses

11. The Puppeteer

12. Zack Addy

 Booth and Brennan’s Daughter Is 
Named Christine Angela Booth - She was 
named after Brennan’s mother, Christine, 
and Angela, her best friend — a touching 
tribute to both women.

 Jack Hodgins Was Referred to as “The 
King of the Lab” - His love of bugs, 
particulates, and conspiracy theories made 
him one of the show’s quirkiest and most 
beloved characters.

 The Series Was Known for Its Dark 
Humour - Despite the grim subject matter, 
Bones was often praised for blending crime-
solving with smart, often morbid, humour.

 The Makeup and Special Effects Team 
Won Awards - Their work on decomposed, 
burned, and disfigured bodies was 
frequently noted as being TV’s most 
realistic.

 The Cast Celebrated Milestones with 
On-Set Parties - For the 100th and 200th 
episodes, the team had cake, cast reunions, 
and behind-the-scenes photo shoots.

 Temperance Brennan Wrote Fictional 
Novels in the Show — Just Like Kathy 
Reichs - Brennan’s in-universe novels 
feature a fictional character named Kathy 
Reichs, flipping the real-world dynamic.
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